

Greater Portland Council of Governments  
Cooperative Purchasing Program

2020 Crack Sealing Bid Results	Berwick			Cape Elizabeth			Fryeburg			Naples			Standish			Windham			Yarmouth			Total Gallons
Bidders	Estimated budget	Bid price per gallon or lf	Estimated gallons	Estimated budget	Bid price per gallon or lf	Estimated gallons	Estimated budget	Bid price per gallon or lf	Estimated gallons	Estimated budget	Bid price per gallon or lf	Estimated gallons	Estimated budget	Bid price per gallon or lf	Estimated gallons	Estimated budget	Bid price per gallon or lf	Estimated gallons	Estimated budget	Bid price per gallon or lf	Estimated gallons	
Coastal Road Repair, LLC Windham, Maine	\$ 10,000	\$ 19.00	526	\$ 6,000	\$ 19.00	316	\$ 16,000	\$ 19.00	842	\$ 25,000	\$ 19.00	1,316	\$ 20,000	\$ 19.00	1,053	\$ 20,000	\$ 19.00	1,053	\$ 8,500	\$ 19.00	447	5,553
pavement milling/linear foot*	Minimum 265 gallons per shift			Minimum 265 gallons per shift			Minimum 265 gallons per shift			Minimum 265 gallons per shift			Minimum 265 gallons per shift			Minimum 265 gallons per shift			Minimum 265 gallons per shift			
	no bid			no bid			no bid			no bid			no bid			no bid			no bid			
Sealcoating Inc. d/b/a Indus Braintree, Massachusetts	\$ 10,000	\$ 20.74	482	\$ 6,000	\$ 20.74	289	\$ 16,000	\$ 20.74	771	\$ 25,000	\$ 20.74	1,205	\$ 20,000	\$ 20.74	964	\$ 20,000	\$ 20.74	964	\$ 8,500	\$ 20.74	410	5,087
pavement milling/linear foot	\$ 0.24			\$ 0.24			\$ 0.24			\$ 0.24			\$ 0.24			\$ 0.24			\$ 0.24			
Sealcoating Inc. d/b/a Indus Braintree, Massachusetts <b>ALTERNATE: PCRM w/FIBERS</b>	\$ 10,000	\$ 12.99	770	\$ 6,000	\$ 12.99	462	\$ 16,000	\$ 12.99	1,232	\$ 25,000	\$ 12.99	1,925	\$ 20,000	\$ 12.99	1,540	\$ 20,000	\$ 12.99	1,540	\$ 8,500	\$ 12.99	654	8,122
pavement milling/linear foot	\$ 0.24			\$ 0.24			\$ 0.24			\$ 0.24			\$ 0.24			\$ 0.24			\$ 0.24			

\*CRR did not include a price for pavement milling in its bid; in response to a follow-up email without sharing bid results, they quoted \$1.00 per linear foot with a 2,500lf minimum per shift